
RESOLUTIONNo. ffi ffi $t0 
Real'firrn tlre City's commitment to watershecl health under the Portland l4/atershed Manageme.nl 
P/an (Resolution) 

WHEI{EAS, Portland strives to be a moclel of sustainable urban development ancl stonnwater 
rxanagen'ìent, with healthy urban watersheds, strearns and rivers for people, fish and wildlife; and 

WHEREAS, working for liealtliy urban watersheds supports otl-rer city goals and objectives, 
including rnitigating and adapting to clirnate change; providing access to nature, clean air and 
clean water for all resiclents; protecting Portland's rich natural resource and cultural heritage; 
fostering economic development ancl supporting public health; and 

WHEREAS, on March S, 2006, the City Council adopted Actions.fìtr" l4tatershed LIealth, the 
2005 Pc¡rtland l4/atershed Management Plan as binding city policy (lìesolution No. 3ó384), 
based on the scientific foundation of the Frantev,orlr.for [ntegrated Management o.f I4/atershed 
I-Iealth (2005) and previous watershed planning and analysis efforts; and 

WHEREAS, the Portland Watershed Managem.ent Plan promotes an integrated, watershed­
based approach to adclress the City's related obligations under regional, state and federal 
environmental laws including, but not limited to, the Clean Water Act (CWA), Safe Drinking 
Water Act (SDWA), Cornprehensive Environmental Response Compensation and Liability Act 
(CERCLA, AKA Superfund), the Endangered Species Act and Title l3 of the Urban Growth 
Management Functional Plan (Metro); and 

WHEREAS, the PorÍland í4/atershed Management PIan is a critical component of the City's 
stormwater management program and a provides an essential building block fòr the City's 
compliance with its state-issued NPDES Municipal Separate Stonn Sewer Systern (M54) 
discharge perrnit; and 

WHEREAS, the Portland llatershed Management Pl.an outlines the City's four watershed health 
goals of irnprovir-rg hydrology, physical liabitat, water quality and biological cornrnunities, 
through six key strategies; and 

WHEREAS, the Portland lilatershed Management Plan is a guide for all City bureaus to 
advance and integrate projects, plaus and activities in ways that will protect and irnprove the 
quality of Porlland's urban watershecls; and 

WHEIìEAS, the City arid countless paftners have declicated considerable effort and resources to 
watershed health related projects, programs and policies since 2006, as documented in annual 
repoús for the Portland Watershed Managemcnt Plan and various related programs; ancl 

WHEREAS, the City has cleveloped the Terrestrial Ecology and Enhancenlent Strategy (TEES) 
as a teclrnical irnplementation clocument for the Portland Watershed Mcmagement Plan that 
establishes a cornlnotl body of infonnation and sets watershed priorities for the conservation ancl 

restoration of terrestrial plant and animal species and habitats in Portland, tcl help achieve the 
waterslred healtli goals and objectives in the Plan; and 

WI'IEI{EAS, the City is implementing a new citywide watershcd health rnonitoring approach 
called the Poftland Area Watershecl Monitoring and Assessment Prograrn (PAWMAP) that will 
allow for consistgnt tracking and reportirrg of watershecl conditions over time towards watershed 
health targets; ancl 
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V/HEREAS, continued progress towards watershed health in Portland relies on continued strong 
policy leadership, inter-bureau coordination, scientific research and monitoring, collaboration 
with community groups and residents, partnership and coordination with other state, local and 
federal agencies; and 

WHEREAS, as the goals and strategies adopted in the Portland ll/atershed Management Plan 
remain relevant and support numerous other City plans such as the Climate Action Plan, Urban 
Forestry Management Plan and the Portland Plan, the City has created a 5-Year Implementation 
Strategy to guide watershed plan efforts in 2012-2017; and 

NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, that the City Council reaffirms Portland's 
commitment to improving urban watershed health to attain the goals and objectives of the 
Portland IMatershed Management Plan; and 

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the Bureau of Environmental Services, as custodian of the 
Portland Watershed Management Plan, will continue to lead implementation as related to the 
bureau's mission, update background documents to the plan as needed, and work with other 
bureaus to promote best practices and innovative approaches to improving Portland's watershed 
health; and 

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, City bureaus, in carrying out their respective missions, shall 
consider water and watershed protection and restoration in policy making, planning, project 
design, and implementing actions, and seek opportunities wherever feasible to assure such 
protection and restoration; and 

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, the watershed health goals and objectives will inform the City's 
policies, plans and projects, recognizing that both protecting and restoring Portland's natural 
resources and incorporating watershed functions into the built environment is needed to maintain 
essential infrastructure for managing stormwater, support biodiversity, bolster climate resiliency, 
protect public health and safety, and preserve and enhance neighborhood livability; and 

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, the City will include watershed health policies and goals in the 
update to the City's Comprehensive Plan to inform how the city grows and develops. 

Adopted by the Council, MAY 0 2 20112 

Dan Saltzman 
Commissioner of Public Affairs 

Sara Culp 
April 16,2012 

LaVonne Griffin-Valade 
Auditor of the City of Portland 
By 

Deputy 
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